

Individual Horse Past Performances - Lifetime: Spark Sept (Fr)

**Spark Sept (Fr)**

Own: Tanaka Gary A

Dk. b or b. m. 10 (Mar)  
 Sire: Septieme Ciel (Seattle Slew)  
 Dam: Sparkline (Akarad\*Fr)  
 Br: Yves Borotra (Fr)  
 Tr: Burke D J II

Life	19	2	2	3	\$90,269	90	D.Fst	1	0	0	0	\$0	40
2005	2	0	0	0	\$4,300	81	Wet(304)	0	0	0	0	\$0	-
2004	6	0	1	1	\$17,530	88	Synth	0	0	0	0	\$0	-
							Turf(306)	18	2	2	3	\$90,269	90

14Apr05-7SA fm	1 1/8	Ⓞ	.47	1:11	1:35	1:48	4*	ⓄAlw 57600n2x	78	9	912	912	97 1/4	76 1/2	Baze M C	LB118	66.40	82-13	DremsComeTrue118 1/2 EmmsPrincess118 1/2 Dest118 1/2	Saved ground to lane 9	
25Feb05-3SA gd	1 1/8	Ⓞ	.47	1:11	1:35	1:48	4*	ⓄAlw 65800c	81	7	56	47 1/2	34 1/2	55	47 1/2	Russell C7	LB113	26.00	78-17	Midwife123 1/2 Belle Ange118 3/4 Ask for the Moon118 2/3	Came out str,no rally 7
17Nov04-7Hol fm	1 1/8	Ⓞ	.48	1:12	1:36	1:49	1+3*	ⓄAlw 42000n2x	88	2	53 1/2	55	51 1/2	31 1/2	2 <sup>no</sup>	Douglas R R	LB119	15.80	85-15	Navaja121 <sup>no</sup> Spark Sept119 3/4 Conspiring121 <sup>5</sup>	Came out str,willing 5
26Sep04-8BM fm	1 1/8	Ⓞ	.23	1:23	1:47	1:10	3*	ⓄOC 50k/n2x-N	82	2	54	45	42 1/4	22 1/2	32 1/2	Rollins C J	LB116	4.10	90-11	DevilDncing116 <sup>nk</sup> AlmondBlossom118 2/3 SprkSpt116 1/2	Angled 2w 1/4p, even 8
13Aug04-7Dmr fm	1 1/8	Ⓞ	.48	1:12	1:36	1:47	3*	ⓄOC 62k/n2x-N	76	3	53 1/2	43 1/2	31	33 1/2	45 1/2	Puglisi I	LB119	*2.20e	85-08	Test the Waters121 1/2 Good Student119 3/4 Uraib119 2/3	In tight early,no bid 8
21Jly04-4Dmr fm	1 1/8	Ⓞ	.24	1:23	1:48	1:12	3*	ⓄOC 62k/n2x-N	73	10	42 1/2	54	83 3/4	86 1/4	75 1/2	Puglisi I	LB119	66.00	84-09	Theater R. N.119 1/4 Uraib119 <sup>nk</sup> Taygete116 1/2	4wd into lane,no bid 0
26May04-5Hol fm	1 1/4	Ⓞ	.48	1:12	1:36	1:48	4*	ⓄOC 62k/n2x-N	76	3	85 3/4	86 1/4	76 1/2	76	81 1/4	Puglisi I	LB118 b	65.20	78-13	Light Jig120 1/2 Night Games122 <sup>hd</sup> Go On Baby118 1/2	Split foes lane,no bid 9
29Apr04-7Hol fm	1 1/4	Ⓞ	.52	1:16	1:40	1:20	3*	ⓄAlw 54000n2x	74	4	11	11 1/2	1 <sup>hd</sup>	31	65	Puglisi I	LB118	9.20	69-21	Kirtle118 1/2 Tifonica118 1/2 Kiss And Fly118 1/4	Set slow pace,wknd 7
17Dec03-6Hol fm	1 1/8	Ⓞ	.24	1:11	1:31	1:41	3*	ⓄAlw 43000n2x	83	6	43 1/2	43 1/2	43 1/2	44	33 1/2	Solis A	LB119	12.10	85-14	Magnificent Val119 1/4 Daneleta119 2/3 Spark Sept119 1/4	3wd into lane,3rd best 9
30Oct03-7SA fst	1		.22	1:23	1:45	1:10	3*	ⓄAlw 53000n2x	40	4	21	22 1/2	59 1/2	51 1/4	62 <sup>28</sup> 1/2	Espinoza V	LB118	12.90	65-09	Star Parade118 2/3 Sophisticatedbluff120 1/2 Lyncola120 2/3	Gave way,eased 6
29Aug03-7Dmr fm	1 3/8	Ⓞ	.47	1:11	1:35	1:48	3*	ⓄCTT&TOCH76k	78	3	65 1/2	65 1/2	66	69 1/2	51 1/2	Valdivia J Jr	LB115	18.90	88-03	Crazy Ensign121 1/2 Makam110 2/3 Tifonica116 1/4	Waited bit 3/8,no bid 9
21Jun03-3Hol fm	1	Ⓞ	.24	1:11	1:31	1:35	4*	ⓄAlw 55000n2x	85	4	44	35	33 1/2	31 1/2	42 1/2	Nakatani C S	LB118	2.70e	85-18	Mistic Sun118 <sup>no</sup> Reefs Sis118 <sup>hd</sup> Spring Star118 2/3	3wd into str,outkicked 7
25May03-6Hol fm	1 1/8	Ⓞ	.23	1:23	1:47	1:11	4*	ⓄAlw 55000n2x	90	3	67 1/2	67	52 1/2	32 1/2	21 1/2	Puglisi I	LB118	15.00	84-13	Runaway Pro120 1/2 Spark Sept118 <sup>nk</sup> Ella Eria118 2/3	Saved ground to lane 7
11Apr03-2BM fm	1	Ⓞ	.23	1:23	1:46	1:11	4*	ⓄOC 62k/n2x-N	74	4	55 1/2	53 1/2	51 3/4	65	56 3/4	Alvarado F T	LB116	2.20	83-14	WatershedPark118 1/4 CarteMder118 <sup>no</sup> Redmond116 3/4	Fanned 4w, empty 6
120Oct02-9Crc fm	1 1/8	Ⓞ	.49	1:13	1:37	1:48		ⓄCalderOaks200k	85	5	55 3/4	54 1/4	75	55	44 1/2	Blanc B	L114	4.80	82-11	CellsShirz118 1/2 Mlizio118 <sup>nk</sup> SomthingVnturd115 1/2	Slow st, no late gain 9
3Sep02-Longchamp (Fr)	gd		*1 1/4	Ⓞ	RH 2:06 2/3			ⓄPrix de Liancourt (Listed)								Pasquier S	123	20.70	Spark Sept123 1/2 Whim123 <sup>hd</sup> Princess Mix123 1/4	Tracked leaders,led 170y out,driving 11	
Racing Post Rating:														105+							
9Jly02-Deauville (Fr)	sf		*1 1/4	Ⓞ	RH 2:11 1/4			ⓄPrix de Bourgeauville								Pasquier S	123	5.50	Sort116 <sup>no</sup> Restless Rixa123 1/2 La Gomera123 <sup>nk</sup>	Tracked in 4th,brief bid over 1f out,hung,Kid Gloves 7th 11	
Racing Post Rating:														84							
13Jun02-Maisons-Laffitte (Fr)	gd		*1 1/4	Ⓞ	RH 2:07 1/4			ⓄPrix Galatee								Pasquier S	121	8.40	Spark Sept121 <sup>nk</sup> Belle Allemande121 1/2 Kid Gloves121 <sup>no</sup>	Rated in 5th,quickened to lead 50y out.Seacleef 5th 17	
Racing Post Rating:														82+							
31Oct01-Compiègne (Fr)	sf		*1 1/8	Ⓞ	LH 1:58 3/8			ⓄPrix des Bruyeres-EBF								Pasquier S	126	7.70	Seacleef118 3/4 Lorigane126 2/3 Spark Sept126 3/4	Rated in 7th,finished well without threatening 13	
Racing Post Rating:														71							